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Right Women PAC Endorses Anna Paulina Luna in  

Florida’s Thirteenth Congressional District  
 

 
WASHINGTON, DC – Right Women PAC announced today its endorsement of Anna Paulina Luna, 
candidate for Florida’s Thirteenth Congressional District.  
 
Luna, who ran in 2020 to defeat ultra-liberal Charlie Crist, has announced that she will run for the 
seat again in 2022. Crist, a career politician, has announced he will run for governor again, leaving 
this seat open. With Florida’s redistricting, it is possible that the 13th District of Florida will become 
slightly more Republican.  
 
Luna’s spirited campaign in 2020 garnered the attention of conservative grassroots activists across 
the country. President Donald Trump endorsed Anna in the 2020 cycle, as well. During that 
campaign, Twitter banned Anna Paulina Luna’s account – a badge of honor for true conservatives 
who speak their minds. Luna demonstrated her tenacity after the Twitter ban, as she successfully 
connected with residents in the 13th District of Florida through other means. Conservatives can 
count on Anna to defend free speech and rein in Big Tech.   
 
Anna Paulina Luna is an Air Force veteran and small-business owner who always stands firm in her 
conservative convictions. Today she speaks directly to all of the communities in her district through 
her popular conservative Hispanic radio show.  
 
“Right Women today endorsed Anna Paulina Luna again this cycle. Right Women was so proud of 
the campaign she ran in 2020, and we look forward to her victory in 2022,” said Debbie Meadows, 
Executive Director of Right Women PAC. “She is an enthusiastic defender of the dignity of human 
life, and a champion for our Second Amendment rights. Her voice is needed in Congress.”  
 
“Anna is committed to helping our nation implement the America First agenda.  As a business 
owner, Anna understands what we need to do for a full economic recovery, and she will work to 
implement those reforms once elected,” said Right Women Board Member Amy Kate Budd.  
 
Right Women PAC’s mission is simple and strategic: to help elect genuinely conservative women to 
Congress. Right Women only endorses women candidates who demonstrate they are: pro-
Constitution, pro-life, supportive of President Trump’s America First agenda, staunch defenders of 
the Second Amendment and law enforcement agents, and advocates for border security, religious 
freedom, Israel, and our veterans. 
 
For more information about Right Women’s endorsed candidates, visit www.RightWomen.com. 
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